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Against the backdrop of international conventions and their implementation, Cultural Property and
Contested Ownership explores how highly-valued cultural goods are traded and negotiated among diverging
parties and their interests. Cultural artefacts, such as those kept and trafficked between art dealers, private
collectors and museums, have become increasingly localized in a ‘Bermuda triangle’ of colonialism, looting
and the black market, with their re-emergence resulting in disputes of ownership and claims for return. This
interdisciplinary volume provides the first book-length investigation of the changing behaviours resulting
from the effect of the 1970 UNESCO Convention on the Means of Prohibiting and Preventing the Illicit
Import, Export and Transfer of Ownership of Cultural Property. The collection considers the impact of the
Convention on the way antiquity dealers, museums and auction houses, as well as nation states and local
communities, address issues of provenance, contested ownership, and the trafficking of cultural property.
The book contains a range of contributions from anthropologists, lawyers, historians and archaeologists.
Individual cases are examined from a bottom-up perspective and assessed from the viewpoint of
international law in the Epilogue. Each section is contextualised by an introductory chapter from the editors.
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From reader reviews:

Bernard Martin:

Do you one among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on
guys this kind of aren't like that. This Cultural Property and Contested Ownership: The trafficking of
artefacts and the quest for restitution book is readable through you who hate the perfect word style. You will
find the information here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience without leaving perhaps decrease the
knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer involving Cultural Property and Contested Ownership: The
trafficking of artefacts and the quest for restitution content conveys objective easily to understand by many
individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it just different in the form of
it. So , do you nevertheless thinking Cultural Property and Contested Ownership: The trafficking of artefacts
and the quest for restitution is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Mary Perry:

This Cultural Property and Contested Ownership: The trafficking of artefacts and the quest for restitution are
reliable for you who want to be considered a successful person, why. The reason why of this Cultural
Property and Contested Ownership: The trafficking of artefacts and the quest for restitution can be one of
many great books you must have will be giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed you
with information that perhaps will shock your preceding knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can
bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed ones. Beside that this
Cultural Property and Contested Ownership: The trafficking of artefacts and the quest for restitution forcing
you to have an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that we
all know it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Marvin Boyer:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind ability
or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book compared to can
satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all this time you only find reserve that need more time to
be examine. Cultural Property and Contested Ownership: The trafficking of artefacts and the quest for
restitution can be your answer since it can be read by anyone who have those short spare time problems.

Jeremy Robinson:

Guide is one of source of knowledge. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen need book to know the update information of year in order to year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the
world. With the book Cultural Property and Contested Ownership: The trafficking of artefacts and the quest
for restitution we can have more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? To get creative person must
like to read a book. Simply choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to



change your life with this book Cultural Property and Contested Ownership: The trafficking of artefacts and
the quest for restitution. You can more attractive than now.
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