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This interdisciplinary study engages law, history, and political theory in a first attempt to crystallize the
lessons the global 'refugee crisis' can teach us about the nature of international law. It connects the dots
between the actions of Jewish migrants to Palestine after WWII, Vietnamese 'boatpeople', Haitian refugees
seeking to reach Florida, Middle Eastern migrants and refugees bound to Australia, and Syrian refugees
currently crossing the Mediterranean, and then legal responses by states and international organizations to
these movements. Through its account of maritime migration, the book proposes a theory of human rights
modelled around an encounter between individuals in which one of the parties is at great risk. It weaves
together primary sources, insights from the work of twentieth-century thinkers such as Hannah Arendt and
Emmanuel Levinas, and other legal materials to form a rich account of an issue of increasing global concern.
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From reader reviews:

Lauren Graves:

Now a day people that Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by connect with the internet and
the resources included can be true or not call for people to be aware of each facts they get. How many people
to be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Studying a book
can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Humanity at Sea: Maritime
Migration and the Foundations of International Law (Cambridge Studies in International and Comparative
Law) book because this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred
percent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

David Anthony:

The book Humanity at Sea: Maritime Migration and the Foundations of International Law (Cambridge
Studies in International and Comparative Law) will bring one to the new experience of reading a book. The
author style to spell out the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to learn, this book very
appropriate to you. The book Humanity at Sea: Maritime Migration and the Foundations of International
Law (Cambridge Studies in International and Comparative Law) is much recommended to you to see. You
can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Melinda Anderson:

Is it a person who having spare time then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or just
resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Humanity at Sea: Maritime Migration and the
Foundations of International Law (Cambridge Studies in International and Comparative Law) can be the
solution, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your free time
by reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these books have than the
others?

Gregory Anderson:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the very
best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is known as of book
Humanity at Sea: Maritime Migration and the Foundations of International Law (Cambridge Studies in
International and Comparative Law). You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed
book, it might add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most important that, you
must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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