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"I love reading Lois Gladys Leppard's books! I find it practically impossible to put them down!" writes a
young reader from Northern Ireland.

Mandie is excited about going home for Christmas, but she hasn't told her grandmother that she invited
Jonathan Guyer and his father to visit them during the holidays. Will Mrs. Taft be angry with Mandie
because she doesn't get along with Mr. Guyer? And Mandie hasn't told Joe that Jonathan is coming, and the
two boys haven't gotten along well either. Will Joe be upset with Mandie?

Then on a dark, cold night a mysterious gift is left on the doorstep of the Shaw house with an anonymous
note attached that reads, "For Mandie." The box has fancy gift wrapping on the outside, but inside is what
appears to be a childish jumble of holly and dirt and ribbons. Whatever could it be?

Who sent Mandie the present? Could it be a treasure map?
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From reader reviews:

April Wages:

Book is definitely written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can understand everything you want
by a publication. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important matter to bring us
around the world. Beside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A e-book Mandie and the
Unwanted Gift (Mandie, Book 29) will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel more confidence if
you can know about anything. But some of you think that will open or reading the book make you bored. It is
not necessarily make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or
acceptable book with you?

Alan Durham:

The event that you get from Mandie and the Unwanted Gift (Mandie, Book 29) could be the more deep you
rooting the information that hide in the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It doesn't mean
that this book is hard to understand but Mandie and the Unwanted Gift (Mandie, Book 29) giving you joy
feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in specific way that can be understood by anyone who read
the idea because the author of this book is well-known enough. This specific book also makes your own
personal vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book
style are available. We suggest you for having this specific Mandie and the Unwanted Gift (Mandie, Book
29) instantly.

Barbara Gunter:

Precisely why? Because this Mandie and the Unwanted Gift (Mandie, Book 29) is an unordinary book that
the inside of the book waiting for you to snap that but latter it will surprise you with the secret that inside.
Reading this book close to it was fantastic author who all write the book in such wonderful way makes the
content inside of easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it
is good for you because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This excellent book
will give you a lot of rewards than the other book have got such as help improving your expertise and your
critical thinking means. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I had been you I will go to the
publication store hurriedly.

Alberto Alvarez:

Many people spending their time by playing outside along with friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book really can hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It okay you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Mandie and the Unwanted
Gift (Mandie, Book 29) which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.
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