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THE NATURE AND SOURCES OF THE LAW is a legal and jurisprudential classic, finally available in a
high-quality, modern edition. Quid Pro's republication of the second edition, 1921, of Gray's foundational
book features updated formatting, accurate reproduction, consistency with the new eBook edition, embedded
page numbers from the original (aiding citation and referencing, as well as classroom assignment), and 2012
notes of the series editor. Most reprints of this classic text, at any price, follow the previous edition and are
merely photocopied versions of that 1909 text. [Publisher's note: although this description may appear under
reprints by others, only the Quid Pro editions have the accurate reproduction, use of the second edition,
parallel eBook edition, and modern formatting. Look for the portrait of Gray in an etching and the publisher
name Quid Pro.] John Chipman Gray was a noted lawyer and legal scholar of the progressive era, a professor
at Harvard Law School, and a founder of the Boston law firm Ropes & Gray. His important book analyzed
the uses of precedent and custom, the meaning of law and legal rights, the differences between common law
and civil law reasoning, deference to and interpretation of statutes and their occasional obsolescence, the role
of morality and popular will, and the philosophical failings of Austin, Blackstone, and German thinkers of
the day. It is a remarkable set piece in legal theory and history. Gray's anatomy of the concept of law is part
of the canon of legal thought from the progressive era. Legal Legends editions of classic works of law and
political philosophy from Quid Pro are unlike any new versions available today, at any price. Also in the
Series are explained and introduced editions of Cardozo's THE NATURE OF THE JUDICIAL PROCESS
(with new material by Harvard's Andrew Kaufman), Holmes' THE [ANNOTATED] COMMON LAW
(adding 200 simple explanatory notes), Holmes' THE PATH OF THE LAW and Warren and Brandeis' THE
RIGHT TO PRIVACY (with additions by Steven Alan Childress of Tulane), Llewellyn's THE BRAMBLE
BUSH (with new introduction by Wisconsin's Stewart Macaulay), and three works by Woodrow Wilson.
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From reader reviews:

Myron Mendez:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the name The Nature and
Sources of the Law suitable to you? The particular book was written by well known writer in this era. Often
the book untitled The Nature and Sources of the Lawis the main one of several books that everyone read
now. This specific book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter
the new shape that you ever know prior to. The author explained their thought in the simple way, and so all
of people can easily to be aware of the core of this book. This book will give you a great deal of information
about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Grant Rickard:

This The Nature and Sources of the Law is great publication for you because the content and that is full of
information for you who have always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute. This
book reveal it facts accurately using great manage word or we can point out no rambling sentences inside it.
So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with
straight forward sentences but tough core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having The Nature
and Sources of the Law in your hand like having the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous one. We
can say that no e-book that offer you world with ten or fifteen tiny right but this publication already do that.
So , this can be good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt that?

Richard Mendoza:

Many people spending their time by playing outside having friends, fun activity with family or just watching
TV all day long. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by examining a book. Ugh, do you
consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like The Nature and Sources
of the Law which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's find.

Roger Richmond:

With this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
valuable than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you
should do is just spending your time very little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of
many books in the top list in your reading list is The Nature and Sources of the Law. This book and that is
qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking right up and
review this publication you can get many advantages.
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