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Life’s Ultimate Questions

Every human being who has ever lived or will ever live has asked, is asking or will ask four basic questions:
Who am I? Why am I here? What is wrong with the world? and How can what is wrong be made right?
While we may not say them, it is in the soul of every person to wrestle with these questions.

 

Allow me to answer these questions first from the perspective of our culture and then from the perspective of
the Bible.

 

ANSWERS FROM OUR CULTURE

 

 Who am I? You are an accident. You are a mistake. You are a glorified ape. You are the result of random
evolutionary process. That’s it. No rhyme. No reason. No purpose. This is the pathetic reality when evolution
runs its full course. If the idea is carried to its logical conclusion, human beings have no value. You are
ultimately nothing.

 

Why am I here? You are here to consume and enjoy. That’s the only thing that matters. When the famous
philanthropist John D. Rockefeller was asked, “How much money is enough?” he was as honest as any man
has ever been. He responded, “Just a little bit more.” Consume and enjoy—that’s why you’re here.

 

What is wrong with the world? People are either insufficiently educated or insufficiently governed. That’s
what’s wrong with the world. People either don’t know enough, or they’re not being watched enough.

 

How can what is wrong be made right?

The solution is more education and more government. Teach people more stuff and give them more
information. How do we combat AIDS? Through AIDS awareness. How do we combat racism? Anti-hate
classes. What about the man who beats his wife? Anger-management classes. Just give people more
information and everything will be fine.



 

The answers provided by our culture leave us wanting and empty. Let’s now take a look at how God’s Word,
the Bible, answers these same questions.

 

ANSWERS FROM THE BIBLE

 

Who am I? You cannot figure out who you are until you first discover who Jesus Christ is. Jesus “is the
image of the invisible God…. by him all things were created…all things were created through him and for
him” (Colossians 1:15-16). He is the exact representation of God. He is the picture of God in human flesh.
He is God on this earth. He is God with us, God among us.  

The Bible says that I am created by God—in his image and likeness (Genesis 1:26). Not the result of random
processes. The Bible says that whether I am tall and beautiful or small and not so handsome, whether my
body functions perfectly or is severely deformed, I am the crowning glory of the creation of God, and as a
result I have inherent dignity, worth, and value.

 

Why am I here? “All things were created through him and for him…. that in everything he might be
preeminent” (Colossians 1:16b–18). The ultimate purpose of all things is to bring glory and honor to Jesus
Christ. That’s why I exist. That is why you exist. And because of this, contrary to the view of our culture, the
reason for my existence goes far beyond consumption and enjoyment.

 

What is wrong with the world?

I am. You are. Despite the fact that we are the crowning glory of the creation of God, created to live and
bring glory and honor to the Lord Jesus Christ, we are instead hostile and disobedient toward the One by
whom and for whom we were created. “All we like sheep have gone astray; we have turned—every one—to
his own way” (Isaiah 53:6). The Bible calls this disobedience towards God “sin”, and it says that “all have
sinned and fall short of the glory of God” (Romans 3:23). In short, sin is what’s wrong with the world.

 

How can what is wrong be made right?  What is wrong can only be made right by the substitutionary,
atoning death of Christ. “He [Jesus] has now reconciled you in his body of flesh by his death, in order to
present you holy and blameless and beyond reproach before him” (Colossians 1:22). There is no other
means by which we can be made right with God. “There is salvation in no one else, for there is no other
name under heaven given among men by which we must be saved” (Acts 4:12).

The Bible says, “For our sake [God] made him [Jesus} to be sin who knew no sin, so that in him we might
become the righteousness of God” (2 Corinthians 5:21). There was nothing else that could have been done
that would have allowed God to be righteous and also the one who makes us right. In the mercy of God the
Father he punished his Son in our place in order to satisfy his righteous wrath against sin. Our only hope is to
believe in Jesus who was crucified for us and rose again (1 Corinthians 1:23, 15:3-4). The sinless Lamb of
God gave his life to pay a debt that he did not owe on behalf of sinners who could never pay him back!



 

The Ultimate Answer

If these two sets of answers—from our culture and from the Bible—are placed side by side, something very
interesting happens. With the answers from our culture, you are left worthless, empty, and hopeless. You’re
on your own to pursue satisfaction…and you’ll never find it. But the Bible says you are precious. You have
purpose. You were purchased.

The only way what is wrong in your life can be made right is for you to believe what the Bible says. Believe
that Jesus took the punishment for your sins by dying on the cross as a substitute for you and that he rose
from the dead three days later, showing that God had accepted his death on the cross as the payment for the
sin-debt that you owed to God. If you believe this to be true, repent of (completely turn from) your sinful
patterns of life, and place your faith completely in Jesus Christ. God promises “if you confess with your
mouth that Jesus is Lord and believe in your heart that God raised him from the dead, you will be saved”
(Romans 10:9).

The Answer to life’s ultimate questions is Christ. Those who walk aimlessly through this life will never be
satisfied with the answers our culture gives. Christ is the only one who will ever satisfy. Have you entrusted
your life to him?
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From reader reviews:

Mae Saari:

The book Life's Ultimate Questions (Pack of 25) (Proclaiming the Gospel) has a lot of knowledge on it. So
when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was published by the very
famous author. The writer makes some research prior to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read
you can get the point easily after looking over this book.

Harriet Blum:

Why? Because this Life's Ultimate Questions (Pack of 25) (Proclaiming the Gospel) is an unordinary book
that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap this but latter it will surprise you with the secret that
inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who also write the book in such wonderful way
makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning
completely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this ever again or you going to regret it. This
unique book will give you a lot of positive aspects than the other book possess such as help improving your
expertise and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to delay having that book? If I were being you I
will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Sheldon McLean:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with close friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. One particular activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you have been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Life's Ultimate Questions (Pack
of 25) (Proclaiming the Gospel), it is possible to enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still wish
to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout people. What? Still don't get it, oh
come on its named reading friends.

Jeffery Chavis:

Life's Ultimate Questions (Pack of 25) (Proclaiming the Gospel) can be one of your nice books that are good
idea. We all recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that can increase your
knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The copy
writer giving his/her effort to get every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Life's Ultimate
Questions (Pack of 25) (Proclaiming the Gospel) although doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the
hottest as well as based confirm resource details that maybe you can be one among it. This great information
could drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial contemplating.
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