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There is a great difference, carefully marked out in the Scriptures, between the ministry of John and that of
Paul and Peter. That of Paul (as stated in Colossians 1), had a twofold character corresponding with the two
headships of Christ; namely, that of the gospel which was preached in the whole creation under heaven,
flowing from Christ’s preeminence in creation; and that of the church, the body of Christ, as connected with
Him as its head. The ministry of Peter, on the other hand, was confined to the circumcision. While he
touches on the church as a spiritual house, which was being built up of believers as living stones on Christ as
the Living Stone, he yet, as guided by the Holy Spirit, views believers in the character of pilgrims on their
way, with Christ risen as their living hope, to “an inheritance incorruptible, and undefiled, and that fadeth not
away, reserved in heaven for you, who are kept by the power of God through faith unto salvation ready to be
revealed in the last time” (1 Peter 1:4-5). But John holds a different place. He does not enter into
dispensations; nor, though once or twice stating the fact (as in John 13:1; John 14:1-3; John 17:24; John
20:17), does he take the saint, nor even the Lord Himself, up to heaven. Jesus, for him, is a Divine Person,
the Word made flesh manifesting God and His Father, eternal life come down to earth. In addition to this,
another kind of ministry was committed to him, even if at the moment mysteriously, by the Lord after His
resurrection, in the words addressed to Peter concerning John, “If I will that he tarry till I come, what is that
to thee?” (John 21:22). For there can scarcely be a question that the book of Revelation is the fulfillment of
the mission for which he was thus designated. It may be said, moreover, that a closer examination reveals an
intimate connection between the last two chapters of his gospel and the Apocalypse. In John 20, in addition
to the setting forth of the assembly as gathered with Christ Himself in the midst, there is the conversion of
the Jewish remnant of a later day, typified by Thomas who believed when he saw. (See Zech. 12:10-13.)
John 21 gives the gathering in of the nations in the millennium, shown in figure by the disciples letting down
their net on the right side of the ship, at the command of the risen Christ, and not being able to draw it for the
multitude of fishes. There are therefore three epochs in these chapters: that of the church, that of the
conversion of the Jewish remnant which will take place at the Lord’s appearing, and that of the ingathering
of the nations after the kingdom has been established in power. The book of Revelation contains these three
epochs presented in a special way after the vision of the Son of Man recorded in Revelation 1, together with
the events in heaven and the judgments upon earth, which are connected with and precede the appearing of
Christ as the rightful Heir to take His power, to make good in government all that God is, as revealed in
relation to the earth, and to reign until all enemies are put under His feet. The eternal state, in all its beauty
and perfection, closes the subject of the book—that wondrous scene wherein God is all in all.

 Download The Visions of John on Patmos: Notes on the Apocal ...pdf

 Read Online The Visions of John on Patmos: Notes on the Apoc ...pdf

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1537639706
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1537639706
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1537639706
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1537639706
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1537639706
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1537639706
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1537639706
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1537639706


Download and Read Free Online The Visions of John on Patmos: Notes on the Apocalypse
(Revelation) Edward Dennett, CrossReach Publications

From reader reviews:

Karen Johnson:

Here thing why this kind of The Visions of John on Patmos: Notes on the Apocalypse (Revelation) are
different and trusted to be yours. First of all reading a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content of
computer which is the content is as delightful as food or not. The Visions of John on Patmos: Notes on the
Apocalypse (Revelation) giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any book out there
but there is no e-book that similar with The Visions of John on Patmos: Notes on the Apocalypse
(Revelation). It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your personal eyes about the thing this happened
in the world which is probably can be happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in playground,
café, or even in your technique home by train. Should you be having difficulties in bringing the published
book maybe the form of The Visions of John on Patmos: Notes on the Apocalypse (Revelation) in e-book
can be your choice.

Glenn Wallin:

The particular book The Visions of John on Patmos: Notes on the Apocalypse (Revelation) has a lot of
information on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was compiled by the
very famous author. This articles author makes some research before write this book. This particular book
very easy to read you can get the point easily after looking over this book.

Renee Chagnon:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to pick book like comic,
limited story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not seeking The Visions of John on Patmos:
Notes on the Apocalypse (Revelation) that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied by reading
this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world
considerably better then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be explained constantly that
reading addiction only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for
all of you who want to start studying as your good habit, you could pick The Visions of John on Patmos:
Notes on the Apocalypse (Revelation) become your own personal starter.

Jimmy Miller:

Beside this specific The Visions of John on Patmos: Notes on the Apocalypse (Revelation) in your phone, it
may give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you
might got here is fresh in the oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow
town. It is good thing to have The Visions of John on Patmos: Notes on the Apocalypse (Revelation) because
this book offers for your requirements readable information. Do you at times have book but you rarely get
what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this inside your hand. The
Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still



want to miss that? Find this book in addition to read it from right now!
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