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While out foraging for interesting things, Vernon the toad finds a new friend - a small blue bird who is
curiously silent. Vernon shows Bird the river and the forest and some of his other favorite things, but Bird
says nothing. Vernon introduces Bird to his friends, Skunk and Porcupine, but Bird still says nothing.

"Bird is shy," says Vernon, "but also a very good listener."

Vernon worries that Bird is silent because he misses his home, so the two set off on a journey to help find a
home for Bird.

This is a tender tale of a thoughtful friend who is determined to help his quiet companion, by the author of A
Sick Day for Amos McGee, winner of the 2011 Caldecott Medal. This title has Common Core connections.

A Home for Bird is a Kirkus Reviews Best Children's Book of 2012
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Hunt:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be revise about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era which is always change and advance. Some of you
maybe can update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to a
person is you don't know what type you should start with. This A Home for Bird is our recommendation so
you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Priscilla Garcia:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book compared to can satisfy
your short time to read it because this all time you only find book that need more time to be learn. A Home
for Bird can be your answer as it can be read by an individual who have those short extra time problems.

Jennifer Bell:

As we know that book is important thing to add our know-how for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This e-book A Home for Bird was filled about science. Spend your spare time to add your
knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading any book. If
you know how big selling point of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like
currently, many ways to get book you wanted.

Charles Hopper:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from the book. Book is created or printed or created from each source which filled update of
news. On this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media
social just like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or
just trying to find the A Home for Bird when you required it?
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