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Grid Journal

Approximate size of squares = quarter of an inch.

A zentangle piano adorn the cover of this journal sure to be perfect for all of your stories! Printed in matte,
the cover is suitable for coloring as well!

Keeping a diary is not only fun, it's therapeutic. Use it to keep track of the good as well as the not so good.
Work out your thoughts and feelings putting word to paper, then close the book until the next adventure!

We think you'll enjoy looking back on your journey in years to come and even have a laugh at some of the
milestones you weren't too happy about at the time.

Light gray lines are easily covered by your creative colored pens or pencils.●

8.5 x 11 large size provides more writing space.●

130 pages in grid/graph paper style.●

Approximate size of squares = 1/4 of an inch.●

Matte cover is suitable for coloring.●

Great for bullet journaling, doodling, writing and more!●

Makes the perfect gift!●

Best suited for craft, hobby and personal uses. Not subjects such as math courses.●

Have fun!

Check our site for more journals, planners & coloring books: www.diaryjournalbook.com

TAGS: grid paper, graph paper, grid journal, journal, diary, blank book, notebook, journal writing,
journaling, bullet journaling, dream journal, utility book, piano, music, zentangle, zia tangle, write your own
story, gray lined journal.
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From reader reviews:

Melissa Chandler:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and
notice by means of surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated the idea for a
while is reading. Yep, by reading a book your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand up than
other is high. For you who want to start reading a new book, we give you this particular Grid Journal:
Zentangle Piano Cover Diary Notebook: 8.5 x 11 size 130 pages, perfect for bullet journaling! book as starter
and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Florence Davis:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading routine give you lot
of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the book
that improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of publication you read,
if you want send more knowledge just go with training books but if you want really feel happy read one
having theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The particular Grid Journal: Zentangle Piano
Cover Diary Notebook: 8.5 x 11 size 130 pages, perfect for bullet journaling! is kind of book which is giving
the reader unstable experience.

George Rodriguez:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new info.
When you read a guide you will get new information simply because book is one of numerous ways to share
the information or their idea. Second, studying a book will make you actually more imaginative. When you
looking at a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring someone to imagine the story how the
people do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to others. When you read this Grid Journal:
Zentangle Piano Cover Diary Notebook: 8.5 x 11 size 130 pages, perfect for bullet journaling!, you could
tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire average, make
them reading a e-book.

Lynn Jordan:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to you is Grid Journal: Zentangle Piano Cover Diary Notebook: 8.5 x 11 size 130 pages,
perfect for bullet journaling! this reserve consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world now.



This specific book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer make
usage of to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some investigation when he makes this
book. That's why this book acceptable all of you.
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