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Brilliantly researched, authoritatively crafted by a prize-winning biographer, and lively on the page,
this is the Nixon we've been waiting for.

Richard Nixon opens with young Navy lieutenant "Nick" Nixon returning from the Pacific and setting his
cap at Congress, an idealistic dreamer seeking to build a better world. Yet amid the turns of that now
legendary 1946 campaign, Nixon's finer attributes quickly gave way to unapologetic ruthlessness. It is a
stunning overture to John A. Farrell's magisterial portrait of a man who embodied postwar American
cynicism.
    Within four years of that first win, Nixon would be a U.S. senator; in six the vice president of the United
States of America. "Few came so far, so fast, and so alone," Farrell writes. Finally president, Nixon's staff
was full of bright young men who devised forward-thinking reforms addressing health care, poverty, civil
rights, and protection of the environment. It was a fine legacy, but Nixon cared little for it. He aspired to
make his mark on the world stage instead, and his 1972 opening to China was the first great crack in the
Cold War.
     Nixon had another legacy, too: an America divided and polarized. It was Nixon who launched the
McCarthy era, who set South against North, and who spurred the Silent Majority to despise and distrust the
country's elites. He persuaded Americans to gnaw, as he did, on grievances—and to look at one another as
enemies. Finally, in August 1974, after two years of the mesmerizing intrigue and scandal known as
Watergate, Nixon became the only president to resign in disgrace.
     Richard Nixon is an enthralling tour de force biography of our darkest president, one that reviewers will
hail as a defining portrait, and the full life of Nixon readers have awaited.
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From reader reviews:

Julie Gailey:

The feeling that you get from Richard Nixon: The Life is the more deep you excavating the information that
hide in the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to know
but Richard Nixon: The Life giving you thrill feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in a
number of way that can be understood by anyone who read that because the author of this publication is
well-known enough. This book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to
understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for
having this particular Richard Nixon: The Life instantly.

Clifford Ranger:

This book untitled Richard Nixon: The Life to be one of several books in which best seller in this year, this is
because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy that book in
the book store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you quicker to read this book, because you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no
reason to you to past this book from your list.

Frances Hairston:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, quick story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not seeking Richard Nixon: The Life that give
your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world can
be said as the means for people to know world much better then how they react toward the world. It can't be
stated constantly that reading habit only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to always be success
person. So , for all of you who want to start reading as your good habit, you could pick Richard Nixon: The
Life become your starter.

Janette Collins:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Make an
effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its protect may
doesn't work here is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in
the outside seem likes. Maybe you answer can be Richard Nixon: The Life why because the fantastic cover
that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content is fantastic
as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly show you to pick up this book.
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