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NUMBERS ARE THE KEYS TO UNIVERSAL KNOWLEDGE."The 'secrets of your mind' are hidden in
your birth numbers - your genetic code, and the 'mysteries of the cosmos' are the cosmic forces - identified
by numbers, working together in cyclic numerical patterns that trigger 'cause and effect' behavioral events in
your life. Ignorance of these patterns is bad luck resulting in accidents, illnesses, problems. Knowledge of
these patterns is good luck, slowing the aging process, lessening the need for practitioners. Example: The
mysterious number 13; is it really bad luck? From whence does it come, what does it cause and how do we
deal with it? The number 13 is not a mystery, although ignorance of it does bring bad luck. Make the
mysterious number 13 work 'for' you, not 'against' you, and beat the system with this new knowledge of
numbers. The Da Vinci Code is fictional! The words Sangreal, or Sang real are meant to confuse us. I have
broken the code of the "Grail" and it is not a 'cup,' 'chalice,' 'plate' etc, but a symbol of these emanating from
the pain (ail) of the Mother (G), the same G (force) in 'G'od, the womb. This vital information has always
been encoded, but camouflaged in the language, as in all the other hidden "secret mysteries" information.
The Da Vinci Code is fictional, but it will act as a 'trigger mechanism' to bring forth the hidden truth about
our 'life force' from the feminine principle - Mary the Mother - I have spoken of for the last thirty years,
buried in lies by the Vatican, and 'they' will seek me out for answers or to silence me. I can be silenced like
Pythagoras, Socrates; even Galileo, but my 'words,' my 'food for thought' will somehow live on.
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From reader reviews:

Angela Gagne:

This How Numbers Control Your Life and Give Your Life Purpose book is not really ordinary book, you
have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is usually information
inside this book incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of
information you will get. That How Numbers Control Your Life and Give Your Life Purpose without we
realize teach the one who looking at it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't end up being worry
How Numbers Control Your Life and Give Your Life Purpose can bring once you are and not make your
case space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even mobile
phone. This How Numbers Control Your Life and Give Your Life Purpose having very good arrangement in
word in addition to layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Darlene Johnson:

The knowledge that you get from How Numbers Control Your Life and Give Your Life Purpose could be the
more deep you rooting the information that hide inside the words the more you get considering reading it. It
doesn't mean that this book is hard to know but How Numbers Control Your Life and Give Your Life
Purpose giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in specific way that
can be understood by simply anyone who read it because the author of this e-book is well-known enough.
This book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go along
with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this How Numbers
Control Your Life and Give Your Life Purpose instantly.

Bobby Tremblay:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, quick story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not hoping How Numbers Control
Your Life and Give Your Life Purpose that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied simply by reading
this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world much better
then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading habit only for the
geeky individual but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for all of you who want to
start looking at as your good habit, you are able to pick How Numbers Control Your Life and Give Your Life
Purpose become your own personal starter.

Heather Lanham:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this How Numbers Control Your Life and Give
Your Life Purpose e-book written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that could be
understand by anyone who else read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, still dripping wet
every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still question How Numbers



Control Your Life and Give Your Life Purpose as good book not simply by the cover but also by the content.
This is one e-book that can break don't determine book by its include, so do you still needing another sixth
sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already said so why you have to
listening to a different sixth sense.
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