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Highway hydraulic structures perform the vital function of conveying, diverting, or removing surface water
from the highway right-of-way. They should be designed to be commensurate with risk, construction cost,
importance of the road, economy of maintenance, and legal requirements. One type of drainage facility will
rarely provide the most satisfactory drainage for all sections of a highway. Therefore, the designer should
know and understand how different drainage facilities can be integrated to provide complete drainage
control. Drainage design covers many disciplines, of which two are hydrology and hydraulics. The
determination of the quantity and frequency of runoff, surface and groundwater, is a hydrologic problem.
The design of structures with the proper capacity to divert water from the roadway, remove water from the
roadway, and pass collected water under the roadway is a hydraulic problem. This publication will briefly
discuss hydrologic techniques with an emphasis on methods suitable to small drainage areas, since many
components of highway drainage (e.g., storm drains, roadside ditches, etc.) service primarily small drainage
areas. Fundamental hydraulic concepts are also briefly discussed, followed by open-channel flow principles
and design applications of open-channel flow in highway drainage. Then, a parallel discussion of closed
conduit concepts and applications in highway drainage will be presented.
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From reader reviews:

Gertrude Call:

With other case, little men and women like to read book Introduction to Highway Hydraulics. You can
choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a new
book Introduction to Highway Hydraulics. You can add expertise and of course you can around the world
with a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can understand everything! From your country until
finally foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you could know that.
In this era, you can open a book or searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You should use it when
you feel weary to go to the library. Let's examine.

Michael Taylor:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
details. When you read a book you will get new information because book is one of various ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, looking at a book will make an individual more imaginative. When
you examining a book especially hype book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the people do
it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to others. When you read this Introduction to
Highway Hydraulics, you could tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours e-book. Your
knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a book.

Robbie Lewis:

The publication with title Introduction to Highway Hydraulics has a lot of information that you can find out
it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This book exist new understanding the information that
exist in this publication represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to find out
how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you in new era of the internationalization.
You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Kelly Mays:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is composed or printed or highlighted from each source in which filled update
of news. Within this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you. From
media social such as newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
seeking the Introduction to Highway Hydraulics when you needed it?
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