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Medical devices today rely extensively on software for a wide variety of functions, but software integration
brings unique challenges in safety-critical medical applications. To equip device manufacturers with
software-focused product lifecycle framework, this study explores three areas: software development
methodologies, risk management practices, and software development tools. The research identifies that the
two most common software development methodologies currently used in the medical device industry are
the traditional Waterfall, and the more recent Agile/Scrum method whose customizations are discussed for
the regulated environment. Some of the risk management best practices include risk-based software
development approach of IEC 62304, Human Factors Engineering (HFE) methods, assurance cases and
FMEA tool. A software lifecycle framework is proposed by integrating risk management practices into the
modified Agile/Scrum methodology. The tools for software development such as requirements,
configuration, build, test and defect management, and those for Application Lifecycle Management (ALM),
are explored to suggest ways in which to automate this framework.
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From reader reviews:

Nathan Wilson:

Why? Because this Medical Device Software: Software Development LifeCycle Methodologies, Tools and
Risk Management is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap the item but
latter it will distress you with the secret that inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who
have write the book in such awesome way makes the content inside of easier to understand, entertaining way
but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this any more or you
going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of positive aspects than the other book have got such
as help improving your ability and your critical thinking method. So , still want to hesitate having that book?
If I have been you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Omar Carter:

Medical Device Software: Software Development LifeCycle Methodologies, Tools and Risk Management
can be one of your basic books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this
reserve has good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit entertaining
but nevertheless delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort to get every word into delight
arrangement in writing Medical Device Software: Software Development LifeCycle Methodologies, Tools
and Risk Management although doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the hottest and based
confirm resource information that maybe you can be one among it. This great information can drawn you
into brand-new stage of crucial thinking.

Albert Gilchrist:

The book untitled Medical Device Software: Software Development LifeCycle Methodologies, Tools and
Risk Management contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains the girl idea with easy technique.
The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read
the idea. The book was authored by famous author. The author will bring you in the new age of literary
works. You can read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or program, so you can read the
book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their
official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice examine.

Jeri McKeen:

Many people spending their time by playing outside with friends, fun activity having family or just watching
TV the entire day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, do you
consider reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It all right you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Medical Device Software:
Software Development LifeCycle Methodologies, Tools and Risk Management which is keeping the e-book
version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.
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