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This book examines post-colonial and post-independence challenges facing South Sudan, both external and
internal factors as it transitions into becoming a nation state. Other focuses are issues that hinder the
implementation of good governance, delivery of services to the people, preservation of the environment and
natural resources, and the unity among South Sudan's multiple ethnicities. The book also briefly touches on
my personal journey in pursuit of elementary and higher education, a rough journey that began in a country
that has been ravaged by a civil war. Therefore, it would serve as informative and inspirational to those who
may face difficult experiences as a refugee or emigrants. In addition, this book supposed to be published in
the summer of 2013; however, the author was caught in a civil war that broke out while on a visit in South
Sudan and he escaped near death twice, in the Juba massacres of the Nuers and the attack on his home town
of Ulang, all were carried out by the South Sudan military, ordered by country's leader, Salva Kiir Mayardit.
As a result, the author was stranded in the remote area of South Sudan for more than a year before he could
finally return to the United States. Since this book is written from Social Responsibility and Social Justice
perspectives, it addresses some of the issues that affect individual and the society as whole. And some of the
Issues covered in this book were among the forecasting challenges and problems that are now facing people
of South Sudan under the leadership of Salva Kiir and some of them came to reality as I predicted them
during the writings of this book.
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From reader reviews:

Alva Sexton:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing
for us to know everything in the world. Each book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
examining a book? Sometime, individual feel need book once they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you will require this The Traumatic Past and Uncertain Future of South Sudan: Perspective from
Social Responsibility on Local and Global issues & the relentless struggle for education..

Sara Pacheco:

Book is actually written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important issue to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A reserve The Traumatic Past and Uncertain Future
of South Sudan: Perspective from Social Responsibility on Local and Global issues & the relentless struggle
for education. will make you to always be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can
know about every thing. But some of you think which open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It
isn't make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or acceptable
book with you?

Linda White:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. One particular activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you are ride on and with addition of information. Even you love The Traumatic Past and
Uncertain Future of South Sudan: Perspective from Social Responsibility on Local and Global issues & the
relentless struggle for education., you may enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still would like to
miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't get it, oh
come on its known as reading friends.

Kelly Jackson:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our expertise for everything. By a publication we can know
everything we wish. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year ended
up being exactly added. This book The Traumatic Past and Uncertain Future of South Sudan: Perspective
from Social Responsibility on Local and Global issues & the relentless struggle for education. was filled
concerning science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your scientific research



competence. Some people has different feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big good
thing about a book, you can sense enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book
that you just wanted.
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