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The Lost Steps (Les Pas perdus) is André Breton’s first collection of critical and polemical essays.
Composed between 1917 and 1923, these pieces trace his evolution during the years when he was emerging
as a central figure in French (and European) intellectual life. They chronicle his tumultuous passage through
the Dada movement, proclaim his explosive views on Modernism and its heroes, and herald the emergence
of Surrealism itself. Along the way, we are given Breton’s serious commentaries on his Modernist
predecessors, Guillaume Apollinaire and Alfred Jarry, followed by his not-so-serious Dada manifestoes.

Also included are portraits of Marcel Duchamp, Francis Picabia, and Breton’s mysterious friend Jacques
Vaché, as well as a crisis-by-crisis account of his dealing with Dada’s leader, Tristan Tzara. Finally, Breton
offers a first glimpse of Surrealism, the movement that was forever after identified with his name and that
stands as a defining force in twentieth-century aesthetics.
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From reader reviews:

Evan Reyes:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students as they are still students or it for all people in the world,
what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has several
personality and hobby per other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't need do that.
You must know how great along with important the book The Lost Steps (French Modernist Library). All
type of book could you see on many resources. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Erin Wright:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different
you can read some sort of book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you
can spent the whole day to reading a e-book. The book The Lost Steps (French Modernist Library) it is quite
good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this
book. When you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can
m0ore easily to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book has high
quality.

Mario Curtin:

The Lost Steps (French Modernist Library) can be one of your starter books that are good idea. Most of us
recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that may increase your
knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information.
The author giving his/her effort to put every word into joy arrangement in writing The Lost Steps (French
Modernist Library) although doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based
confirm resource data that maybe you can be one of it. This great information can drawn you into completely
new stage of crucial imagining.

David Gaiter:

You can obtain this The Lost Steps (French Modernist Library) by go to the bookstore or Mall. Merely
viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve issue if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this
publication are various. Not only by means of written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by means
of e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what their
problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most
important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose correct ways
for you.
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