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Dillard Early, Jr., Travis Bohannon and Lydia Blankenship are three friends from different walks of life who
have one thing in common: none of them seem to fit the mold in rural Tennessee's Forrestville High. Dill has
always been branded as an outsider due to his family heritage as snake handlers and poison drinkers, an
essential part of their Pentecostal faith. But after his father is sent to prison for sexual abuse of a young
parishioner, Dill and his mother become real pariahs. His only two friends are Travis, a gentle giant who
works at his family's lumberyard and is obsessed with a Game of Thrones-like fantasy series (much to his
alcoholic father's chagrin); and Lydia, who runs a popular fashion blog that's part Tavi Gevinson and part
Angela Chase, and is actively plotting her escape from Redneckville, Tennessee.
As the three friends begin their senior year, it becomes clear that they won't all be getting to start a promising
new life after graduation. How they deal with their diverging paths could cause the end of their friendship.
Until a shattering act of random violence forces Dill to wrestle with his dark legacy and find a way into the
light of a future worth living.
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From reader reviews:

Joseph Singleton:

This The Serpent King are generally reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why. The
explanation of this The Serpent King can be on the list of great books you must have is giving you more than
just simple reading through food but feed an individual with information that possibly will shock your
preceding knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your
conditions in e-book and printed ones. Beside that this The Serpent King giving you an enormous of
experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we understand it useful in
your day task. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Shalon Fisk:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
data. When you read a e-book you will get new information simply because book is one of numerous ways to
share the information or maybe their idea. Second, studying a book will make you actually more imaginative.
When you reading a book especially fictional works book the author will bring one to imagine the story how
the character types do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to others. When you read this The
Serpent King, you are able to tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge
can inspire the others, make them reading a book.

Gregorio Leslie:

The guide with title The Serpent King posesses a lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a lot
of help after read this book. That book exist new information the information that exist in this e-book
represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement
of the world. This book will bring you within new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book on your
smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Edna Davis:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the very
best book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is named of book The
Serpent King. You can add your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it can add your
knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware about e-book. It
can bring you from one spot to other place.
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