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First Edition a 2013 Doody‚ Core Title and AJN Book of the Year Award Winner!

This text provides top-tier guidance for DNP students, graduate faculty, APRNs, and other health care
providers on how to use available research for improving patient outcomes and reducing costs. It is the only
resource written expressly to meet the objectives of DNP courses. This second edition is completely updated
and features three new approaches umbrella reviews, mixed-method reviews, and other types of reviews for
seeking, synthesizing, and interpreting available evidence to improve the delivery of patient care. The text
also includes two new examples of completed systematic reviews and two completed proposals.

The book presents, clearly and comprehensively, the knowledge and skills necessary to conduct a
foundational comprehensive systematic review (CSR). It encompasses the complexities of the entire process,
from asking clinical questions to getting the evidence into practice. The text includes question-specific
methods and analysis and compares CSR methods, literature reviews, integrated reviews, and meta-studies. It
describes how to find and appraise relevant studies, including the non-published grey literature and criteria
for selecting or excluding studies, and describes how to use the results in practice. Also examined are ways
to disemminate findings to benefit clinical practice and support best practices, and how to write a CSR
proposal, final report, and a policy brief based on systematic review findings. Plentiful examples, including
two completed proposals and two completed systematic reviews, demonstrate every step of the process. An
expanded resource chapter that can serve as a toolkit for conducting a systematic review is also provided.
The text covers useful software and includes objectives, summary points, end-of-chapter exercises, suggested
reading, and references.

NEW TO THE SECOND EDITION:

Three new chapters presenting new systematic review approaches: umbrella reviews, mixed-method●

reviews, and other types of reviews including rapid and scoping reviews and reviews of text and opinion
Two new examples of completed systematic reviews●

Completely updated content throughout●

Detailed information to foster systematic review research question development, efficient literature●

searches, and management of references

KEY FEATURES:

Delivers the knowledge and skills necessary to conduct a CSR from start to finish●

Serves as the only CSR resource written expressly for the APRN●

Describes useful software for conducting a systematic review●

Provides rich examples including two completed CSRs●

Includes objectives, summary points, end-of-chapter exercises, suggested reading, and references●

Accompanied by a comprehensive toolkit of resources for completing a systematic review●
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From reader reviews:

Gary Glover:

Why? Because this Comprehensive Systematic Review for Advanced Practice Nursing, Second Edition is an
unordinary book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will surprise
you with the secret it inside. Reading this book close to it was fantastic author who have write the book in
such remarkable way makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey
the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to
regret it. This book will give you a lot of gains than the other book have got such as help improving your
skill and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I were you I will go
to the reserve store hurriedly.

Christopher Hairston:

This Comprehensive Systematic Review for Advanced Practice Nursing, Second Edition is great reserve for
you because the content that is certainly full of information for you who all always deal with world and
possess to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it facts accurately using great organize
word or we can declare no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole data
in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but difficult core information with lovely
delivering sentences. Having Comprehensive Systematic Review for Advanced Practice Nursing, Second
Edition in your hand like finding the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say
that no reserve that offer you world with ten or fifteen second right but this book already do that. So , this
really is good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt which?

Betty Bowers:

Reading a book being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to study a book. When you read
a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. In order to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, along with soon. The
Comprehensive Systematic Review for Advanced Practice Nursing, Second Edition provide you with a new
experience in examining a book.

Donna Graham:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is published or printed or created from each source in which filled update of
news. In this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From
media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your



book? Or just trying to find the Comprehensive Systematic Review for Advanced Practice Nursing, Second
Edition when you essential it?
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