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In the 1970s and 1980s the Texas wildcatter was a recognizable figure in popular culture. Since then, the
wildcatter’s role is less celebrated but still important, as shown in the new introduction to this edition of a
book originally published in 1984 by Texas Monthly Press.
 
Drawing heavily on oral histories, this book tells the story of the West Texas independents as a group,
looking at their business strategies in the context of their national, regional, and local conditions. The focus
is on the Permian Basin and southeastern New Mexico over the sixty-year period in which the region rose to
prominence on the American oil scene, producing about one-fifth of the nation’s output. It is a story that
covers vast technological change, governmental regulation, and economic fluctuation with profound
implications for the oil and gas community.
 
The new introduction brings the story up-to-date by addressing not only the subsequent careers of the
wildcatters described in the book but also the role of independents in the current economy.
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From reader reviews:

Angela Rodriguez:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind proficiency
or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book when compared with
can satisfy your short period of time to read it because this time you only find reserve that need more time to
be examine. Wildcatters: Texas Independent Oilmen can be your answer as it can be read by you actually
who have those short free time problems.

Elizabeth Edge:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This specific book Wildcatters: Texas Independent Oilmen was
multi-colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Wildcatters: Texas
Independent Oilmen has many kinds or style. Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Private
eye Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book tend to be
make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for you and try to
like reading that.

Larry Cain:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is different. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the
very best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is known as of
book Wildcatters: Texas Independent Oilmen. Contain your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the
printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most important that, you must
aware about e-book. It can bring you from one destination to other place.

Karen Delamora:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from the book. Book is prepared or printed or illustrated from each source that filled update of
news. On this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From
media social including newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, story and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out
your book? Or just looking for the Wildcatters: Texas Independent Oilmen when you necessary it?
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