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Strength and endurance are essential attributes for any martial artist, affecting everything from how hard you
punch to how high you jump. Whether your goal is to defeat an opponent in the ring or on the street, the
stronger you are, the better the odds of walking away as the victor. 

Fighter's Body, Fighter's Mind: A Comprehensive Guide to Muscular Strength and Endurance Training for
Martial Arts is a total approach to building your strength base. Learn how to use machines, free weights,
bodyweight exercises, and plyometrics to build your muscles while increasing speed and flexibility. Each
muscle group is discussed in detail; how it is used in martial arts and how to develop it; which exercises are
most effective; and how to take advantage of anatomical strengths when striking, kicking, blocking, and
grappling. 

Beyond muscular strength, this book looks at the concepts of cardiovascular strength endurance; the impact
of flexibility on strength; how to gain a psychological edge on your opponent; and the anatomy, physics and
biomechanics of power. The book also covers discussions on whether winners are born or made; what it
means to be fit, and fit for what; principles of overload, progression, and specificity; cross training to prepare
your body for combat; comparisons between male and female physiology; risk factors and practicing while
hurt; and fluid intake and regulating the body's temperature for maximum performance. 

Fighter's Body, Fighter's Mind: A Comprehensive Guide to Muscular Strength and Endurance Training for
Martial Arts wraps up with training plans for karate, tae-kwon-do, hapkido, judo, jiu-jitsu, aikido, muay
Thai/kickboxing and mixed martial arts as well as advice on designing your own personalized strength
training plan. An earlier version of this book (now out of print) was previously published under the title
Strength and Power Training for Martial Arts.
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From reader reviews:

Natalie Hernandez:

In other case, little men and women like to read book Fighter's Body, Fighter's Mind: A Comprehensive
Guide to Muscular Strength and Endurance Training for Martial Arts. You can choose the best book if you
like reading a book. Providing we know about how is important a new book Fighter's Body, Fighter's Mind:
A Comprehensive Guide to Muscular Strength and Endurance Training for Martial Arts. You can add
expertise and of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book
you can learn everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you will end up known. About
simple factor until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or even
searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel fed up to go to the library.
Let's examine.

Jaime Worm:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all know that that
book is very important usually. The book Fighter's Body, Fighter's Mind: A Comprehensive Guide to
Muscular Strength and Endurance Training for Martial Arts was making you to know about other
information and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you. The
reserve Fighter's Body, Fighter's Mind: A Comprehensive Guide to Muscular Strength and Endurance
Training for Martial Arts is not only giving you a lot more new information but also to become your friend
when you feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship
together with the book Fighter's Body, Fighter's Mind: A Comprehensive Guide to Muscular Strength and
Endurance Training for Martial Arts. You never feel lose out for everything in the event you read some
books.

Lori Barnes:

The actual book Fighter's Body, Fighter's Mind: A Comprehensive Guide to Muscular Strength and
Endurance Training for Martial Arts will bring you to the new experience of reading a book. The author style
to explain the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book to read, this book very suited to you. The
book Fighter's Body, Fighter's Mind: A Comprehensive Guide to Muscular Strength and Endurance Training
for Martial Arts is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book through the official
web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Jesus Moreno:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot
of information that will give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can share their
idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their own reader with their story
or perhaps their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the



information about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors in this world always try to improve
their skill in writing, they also doing some research before they write with their book. One of them is this
Fighter's Body, Fighter's Mind: A Comprehensive Guide to Muscular Strength and Endurance Training for
Martial Arts.
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