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An eloquent, controversial argument that says, for the first time in their long history, Jews are free to
live in a Jewish state—or lead secure and productive lives outside it
 
Since the beginnings of Zionism in the twentieth century, many Jewish thinkers have considered it close to
heresy to validate life in the Diaspora. Jews in Europe and America faced “a life of pointless struggle and
futile suffering, of ambivalence, confusion, and eternal impotence,” as one early Zionist philosopher wrote,
echoing a widespread and vehement disdain for Jews living outside Israel. This thinking, in a more
understated but still pernicious form, continues to the present: the Holocaust tried to kill all of us, many Jews
believe, and only statehood offers safety. 
 
But what if the Diaspora is a blessing in disguise? In At Home in Exile, renowned scholar and public
intellectual Alan Wolfe, writing for the first time about his Jewish heritage, makes an impassioned, eloquent,
and controversial argument that Jews should take pride in their Diasporic tradition. It is true that Jews have
experienced more than their fair share of discrimination and destruction in exile, and there can be no doubt
that anti-Semitism persists throughout the world and often rears its ugly head. Yet for the first time in
history, Wolfe shows, it is possible for Jews to lead vibrant, successful, and, above all else, secure lives in
states in which they are a minority.
 
Drawing on centuries of Jewish thinking and writing, from Maimonides to Philip Roth, David Ben Gurion to
Hannah Arendt, Wolfe makes a compelling case that life in the Diaspora can be good for the Jews no matter
where they live, Israel very much included—as well as for the non-Jews with whom they live, Israel once
again included. Not only can the Diaspora offer Jews the opportunity to reach a deep appreciation of
pluralism and a commitment to fighting prejudice, but in an era of rising inequalities and global instability,
the whole world can benefit from Jews’ passion for justice and human dignity.
 
Wolfe moves beyond the usual polemical arguments and celebrates a universalistic Judaism that is
desperately needed if Israel is to survive. Turning our attention away from the Jewish state, where half of
world Jewry lives, toward the pluralistic and vibrant places the other half have made their home, At Home in
Exile is an inspiring call for a Judaism that isn’t defensive and insecure but is instead open and inquiring.
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From reader reviews:

Melvin Loch:

The book At Home in Exile: Why Diaspora Is Good for the Jews can give more knowledge and also the
precise product information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave the great thing like a
book At Home in Exile: Why Diaspora Is Good for the Jews? Several of you have a different opinion about
reserve. But one aim that book can give many data for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer
with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you may give for each other; you can share all of
these. Book At Home in Exile: Why Diaspora Is Good for the Jews has simple shape but the truth is know: it
has great and big function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by open up and read a reserve.
So it is very wonderful.

Bertha Chang:

The reason why? Because this At Home in Exile: Why Diaspora Is Good for the Jews is an unordinary book
that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap it but latter it will zap you with the secret the item inside.
Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who else write the book in such remarkable way makes the
content within easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for
you for not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of
positive aspects than the other book have got such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking
means. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I were being you I will go to the publication store
hurriedly.

Patricia Dennis:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many query for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some people likes
reading through, not only science book but novel and At Home in Exile: Why Diaspora Is Good for the Jews
or even others sources were given information for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel want
to read more and more. Science publication was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those
publications are helping them to add their knowledge. In some other case, beside science book, any other
book likes At Home in Exile: Why Diaspora Is Good for the Jews to make your spare time a lot more
colorful. Many types of book like here.

Nancy Gump:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that issue
was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And also you
know that little person just like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to understand
that reading is very important along with book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you
knowledge, except your teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update concerning something by
book. Amount types of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is niagra At Home in Exile:



Why Diaspora Is Good for the Jews.

Download and Read Online At Home in Exile: Why Diaspora Is
Good for the Jews Alan Wolfe #W57Z2N4RY0I



Read At Home in Exile: Why Diaspora Is Good for the Jews by
Alan Wolfe for online ebook

At Home in Exile: Why Diaspora Is Good for the Jews by Alan Wolfe Free PDF d0wnl0ad, audio books,
books to read, good books to read, cheap books, good books, online books, books online, book reviews epub,
read books online, books to read online, online library, greatbooks to read, PDF best books to read, top books
to read At Home in Exile: Why Diaspora Is Good for the Jews by Alan Wolfe books to read online.

Online At Home in Exile: Why Diaspora Is Good for the Jews by Alan Wolfe ebook
PDF download

At Home in Exile: Why Diaspora Is Good for the Jews by Alan Wolfe Doc

At Home in Exile: Why Diaspora Is Good for the Jews by Alan Wolfe Mobipocket

At Home in Exile: Why Diaspora Is Good for the Jews by Alan Wolfe EPub


