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The unauthorized biography of an immigrant's son whobecame a multibillionaire working for Bill Gates, and
probably the highest-paid employee in American history.

In January 2000, Bill Gates gave his vast responsibilities and title of Microsoft CEO to his best friend Steve
Ballmer, a man relatively unknown to the public. Based on in-depth study and interviews with classmates
and Microsoft insiders, Fredric Alan Maxwell vividly brings to life one of the technology industry's most
colorful and controversial figures: Steven Anthony Ballmer. From Ballmer's relatively humble suburban
Detroit beginnings (where he and his archrival Scott McNealy went to competing high schools) and his 1974
meeting with Gates in a Harvard dorm, Maxwell richly details how the competition addicts Ballmer and
Gates have worked together for the past twenty years to form Microsoft's ego and id. The up-by-the-
bootstraps saga reveals both the good boy Ballmer -- the dedicated son, great friend, and supportive
schoolmate -- and the bad boy Ballmer -- the ruthless businessman who earned the nickname "The Em-
balmer."
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From reader reviews:

Alyssa Lewis:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they're still students or the idea for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has different
personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't would
like do that. You must know how great and also important the book Bad Boy Ballmer: The Man Who Rules
Microsoft. All type of book are you able to see on many solutions. You can look for the internet methods or
other social media.

Anna Thompson:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the concept Bad Boy Ballmer:
The Man Who Rules Microsoft suitable to you? The particular book was written by popular writer in this era.
The actual book untitled Bad Boy Ballmer: The Man Who Rules Microsoftis a single of several books that
everyone read now. This particular book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this reserve
you will enter the new age that you ever know previous to. The author explained their concept in the simple
way, and so all of people can easily to be aware of the core of this reserve. This book will give you a lot of
information about this world now. So that you can see the represented of the world within this book.

Ezra Talbott:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a e-book you will get new information simply because book is one of a number of ways to
share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading a book will make you more imaginative. When
you reading through a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to imagine the story how
the personas do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Bad
Boy Ballmer: The Man Who Rules Microsoft, it is possible to tells your family, friends and soon about yours
publication. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a e-book.

Nicholas Riley:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon. You
will see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The book that recommended for your
requirements is Bad Boy Ballmer: The Man Who Rules Microsoft this publication consist a lot of the
information on the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented so why is the world has
grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made
some research when he makes this book. That's why this book acceptable all of you.
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