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Illustrated by: Jane Adams The Sacred India Tarot is unique in its synthesis of two mystical and meditational
streams of world culture - the Tarot and Indian mythology. They blend amazingly well without
compromising their own truths and cultural integrity. This is the first and only Tarot deck to work
solelywithin the parameters of sacred Indian mythology - almost the only living mythology today.Millions of
people daily worship, or meditate upon, the deities depicted within. This gives The Sacred India Tarot an
unmatched spiritual power and contemporary resonance. The Major Arcana depicts the archetypal forms of
the gods and goddesses of India. The Indian epics, the Ramayana and Mahabharata, form two of the themes
depicted in the suits of the Minor Arcana. Other themes in the suits include the life of the Buddha, and the
great love story of the culture - that of Shiva and Parvati. This stunningly beautiful deck is designed for
readings as well as for meditation. The comprehensive, knowledgeable text in the accompanying Handbook
explains the illustrations as well as their context within the Tarot. It provides insights on various aspects of
Tarot, Indian mythology, card meanings, doing readings, and also includes unique spreads using Indian
symbolism. Contents: 78 Cards + 4 Bonus Cards and 350-page Comprehensive Handbook You can also
order Tarot prints. Tarot prints will be printed on demand.
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From reader reviews:

Ira Knudsen:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to
take a go walking, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or even read a book allowed
The Sacred India Tarot? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You already know beside you can spend
your time with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have
some other opinion?

Nathan Barnes:

This book untitled The Sacred India Tarot to be one of several books in which best seller in this year,
honestly, that is because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy
that book in the book retailer or you can order it via online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you more readily to read this book, since you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no
reason for your requirements to past this guide from your list.

Sondra Spencer:

The e-book with title The Sacred India Tarot has lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot
of help after read this book. This kind of book exist new understanding the information that exist in this
guide represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to understand how the
improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you in new era of the glowbal growth. You can read
the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

George Hyler:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is named of book
The Sacred India Tarot. Contain your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it may add
your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about e-book. It
can bring you from one destination to other place.
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