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TOO TOUGH TO LOVE is Cynthia "Roxy" Whitney's first-person account of her 20-year affair with punk
guitar legend and Ramones co-founder Johnny Ramone - a story that has never been told until now. While
most fans have heard of the notorious love triangle of Johnny, singer Joey Ramone, and Joey's girlfriend
Linda Daniele (later Mrs. Johnny Ramone), very few know that the "triangle" had a fourth side - Roxy. In
her inimitable voice, she gives a no-holds-barred account of her life as a teenaged stripper in 1970s New
York, the early days of punk and the Ramones, and the betrayal that nearly shattered the band. Roxy was
written out of the Ramones' official history, but her relationship with Johnny continued in secret for many
years - even after his marriage to Linda. As told to spoken-word poet Emily XYZ, Roxy's story is full of
vivid, funny, hair-raising and poignant details, and paints a far more complex and human portrait of Johnny
than any other Ramones history or memoir so far.
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From reader reviews:

Tracie Wright:

Now a day people that Living in the era where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each info they get. How people have to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this Too Tough to Love: My Life with
Johnny Ramone book since this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the info in this book
hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Leonard White:

This Too Tough to Love: My Life with Johnny Ramone are usually reliable for you who want to be a
successful person, why. The explanation of this Too Tough to Love: My Life with Johnny Ramone can be on
the list of great books you must have is actually giving you more than just simple reading through food but
feed you with information that might be will shock your prior knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring
it all over the place and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed people. Beside that this Too
Tough to Love: My Life with Johnny Ramone giving you an enormous of experience for example rich
vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day activity. So , let's
have it and revel in reading.

Margaret Coleman:

Often the book Too Tough to Love: My Life with Johnny Ramone has a lot details on it. So when you make
sure to read this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was authored by the very famous author. Tom
makes some research previous to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you may get the point
easily after perusing this book.

Joan Hanson:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many question for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy with regard to
reading. Some people likes examining, not only science book and also novel and Too Tough to Love: My
Life with Johnny Ramone or perhaps others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the
truly great a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher as well as
students especially. Those books are helping them to put their knowledge. In different case, beside science
book, any other book likes Too Tough to Love: My Life with Johnny Ramone to make your spare time much
more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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