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Drawing on recent feminist and psychoanalytic criticism, Cinzia Sartini Blum provides the first analysis of
the rhetoric, politics, and psychology of gender in the avant-garde writings of the Italian Futurist F.T.
Marinetti. Her book explores the relations between the seemingly unrelated goals of Italian Futurism:
technical revolution, espousal of violence, avowed misogyny, and rejection of literary tradition.

Blum argues for the centrality of the rhetoric of gender in Marinetti's work. She also investigates a diverse
array of his futurist textual practices that range from formal experimentation with "words in freedom" to
nationalist manifestos that advocate intervention in World War I and anticipate subsequent fascist rhetoric of
power and virility. A major contribution to the study of the twentieth-century avant-garde and the first full-
length study of Marinetti in English, The Other Modernism will interest all those concerned with twentieth-
century literature, culture, and society and the problem of modern subjectivity.
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From reader reviews:

Sharon Hollars:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to
take a walk, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book allowed The Other
Modernism: F. T. Marinetti's Futurist Fiction of Power? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You
realize beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree
with their opinion or you have various other opinion?

James Hubbard:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they are still students or the idea for all people in
the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every
person has different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be compelled someone or
something that they don't want do that. You must know how great as well as important the book The Other
Modernism: F. T. Marinetti's Futurist Fiction of Power. All type of book would you see on many solutions.
You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Irving Wile:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition info. Even you love The Other Modernism: F. T. Marinetti's
Futurist Fiction of Power, you may enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still wish to miss it?
What kind of hang type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its
called reading friends.

Ana Jimenez:

Many people spending their time by playing outside along with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like The Other Modernism: F. T.
Marinetti's Futurist Fiction of Power which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's
observe.
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