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This book comprises some of the lecture notes I developed for various one-or two-semester courses I taught
at the Colorado School of Mines. The main objective of all the courses was to introduce students to the
mathematical aspects of wave theory with a focus on the solution of some specific fundamental problems.
These fundamental solutions would then serve as a basis for more complex wave propagation and scattering
problems. Although the courses were taught in the mathematics department, the audience was mainly not
mathematicians. It consisted of gradu ate science and engineering majors with a varied background in both
mathematics and wave theory in general. I believed it was necessary to start from fundamental principles of
both advanced applied math ematics as well as wave theory and to develop them both in some detail. The
notes reflect this type of development, and I have kept this detail in the text. I believe it essential in technical
careers to see this detailed development at least once. This volume consists of five chapters. The first two on
Scalar Wave Theory (Chapter 1) and Green's Functions (Chapter 2) are mainly mathematical although in
Chapter 1 the wave equation is derived from fundamental physical principles. More complicated problems
involving spatially and even temporally varying media are briefly introduced.
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From reader reviews:

Gerald Stewart:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive right now,
people have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and
notice by means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated it for a while
is reading. Yep, by reading a e-book your ability to survive raise then having chance to remain than other is
high. For yourself who want to start reading a new book, we give you this kind of Scalar Wave Theory:
Green's Functions and Applications (Springer Series on Wave Phenomena) book as starter and daily reading
publication. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Edith Stewart:

This Scalar Wave Theory: Green's Functions and Applications (Springer Series on Wave Phenomena) are
generally reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why. The reason of this Scalar Wave
Theory: Green's Functions and Applications (Springer Series on Wave Phenomena) can be one of many
great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple studying food but feed a person with
information that maybe will shock your before knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it just
about everywhere and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed ones. Beside that this Scalar
Wave Theory: Green's Functions and Applications (Springer Series on Wave Phenomena) giving you an
enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that could it useful in
your day activity. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Bobbie Burke:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always try and and must have the extra time or they will get great deal
of stress from both everyday life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not really a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity are there
when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then do
you ever try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the
book you have read will be Scalar Wave Theory: Green's Functions and Applications (Springer Series on
Wave Phenomena).

Magdalena McKinney:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside together with friends, fun activity having family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, think reading a book can really hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It alright you
can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Scalar Wave Theory:
Green's Functions and Applications (Springer Series on Wave Phenomena) which is obtaining the e-book
version. So , try out this book? Let's view.
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