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As a neurasthenic, kleptomaniac, man-chasing proto-punk poet and artist, the Baroness Elsa von Freytag-
Loringhoven left in her wake a ripple that is becoming a rip -- one hundred years after she exploded onto the
New York art scene. As an agent provocateur within New York's modernist revolution, "the first American
Dada" not only dressed and behaved with purposeful outrageousness, but she set an example that went well
beyond the eccentric divas of the twenty-first century, including her conceptual descendant, Lady Gaga. Her
delirious verse flabbergasted New Yorkers as much as her flamboyant persona. As a poet, she was profane
and playfully obscene, imagining a farting God, and transforming her contemporary Marcel Duchamp into
M'ars (my arse). With its ragged edges and atonal rhythms, her poetry echoes the noise of the metropolis
itself. Her love poetry muses graphically on ejaculation, orgasm, and oral sex. When she tired of existing
words, she created new ones: "phalluspistol," "spinsterlollipop," "kissambushed." The Baroness's rebellious,
highly sexed howls prefigured the Beats; her intensity and psychological complexity anticipates the poetic
utterances of Anne Sexton and Sylvia Plath. Published more than a century after her arrival in New York,
Body Sweats is the first major collection of Elsa von Freytag-Loringhoven's poems in English. The
Baroness's biographer Irene Gammel and coeditor Suzanne Zelazo have assembled 150 poems, most of them
never before published. Many of the poems are themselves art objects, decorated in red and green ink,
adorned with sketches and diagrams, presented with the same visceral immediacy they had when they were
composed.
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From reader reviews:

James Hubbard:

Book is written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can learn everything you want by a e-book. Book
has a different type. We all know that that book is important matter to bring us around the world. Adjacent to
that you can your reading talent was fluently. A book Body Sweats: The Uncensored Writings of Elsa von
Freytag-Loringhoven (MIT Press) will make you to become smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you
can know about every thing. But some of you think in which open or reading the book make you bored. It
isn't make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or acceptable book
with you?

Eileen Moore:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also become a life style. This reading behavior give you
lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the book
which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of guide you read, if
you want attract knowledge just go with education books but if you want really feel happy read one using
theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Often the Body Sweats: The Uncensored Writings of Elsa
von Freytag-Loringhoven (MIT Press) is kind of book which is giving the reader capricious experience.

David Myers:

The book with title Body Sweats: The Uncensored Writings of Elsa von Freytag-Loringhoven (MIT Press)
has lot of information that you can study it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. That book exist
new understanding the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world
currently. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you
with new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read the idea
anywhere you want.

Daryl Radford:

A lot of guide has printed but it is unique. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the most
beneficial book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is identified as
of book Body Sweats: The Uncensored Writings of Elsa von Freytag-Loringhoven (MIT Press). Contain
your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make an
individual happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from
one location to other place.
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