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Hidden—A Christian romantic suspense Home is where our story begins ... DANA JACOBS would rather
forget the night of tragedy and violence that marred her childhood. She is now supervisor in charge of the
Department of Homeland Security in Taos, New Mexico. Her team is prepared to handle any
threat—biological, chemical, conventional, cyber, even nuclear. BENJAMIN MARSHALL is newly
assigned to Dana’s office. Straight from a six year military deployment, he is not what Dana wants or needs.
Ben knows God has a reason for putting him in this place at this time—to help Dana. When a local school is
threatened, they open a case which leads them on a chase through the Enchanted Circle and Carson National
Forest, pursuing a man filled with a bitterness Dana can understand. But her anger is different. It’s justified,
it remains hidden inside, and it hurts no one. Can Dana face her own mortality? And when she does, can she
truly understand what it means to forgive and to be forgiven?
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From reader reviews:

Mark Clark:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your long lasting
problem; you can add your knowledge by the book entitled Hidden (Jacobs Family Series) (Volume 1). Try
to the actual book Hidden (Jacobs Family Series) (Volume 1) as your good friend. It means that it can to be
your friend when you feel alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than previously. Yeah,
it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you more confidence because you can know anything by the
book. So , we need to make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Robert Reynolds:

Book is definitely written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important matter to bring us around the
world. Next to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A publication Hidden (Jacobs Family Series)
(Volume 1) will make you to always be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about
every thing. But some of you think in which open or reading a new book make you bored. It is not make you
fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you searching for best book or acceptable book with you?

Donald Corbett:

Why? Because this Hidden (Jacobs Family Series) (Volume 1) is an unordinary book that the inside of the
reserve waiting for you to snap it but latter it will surprise you with the secret it inside. Reading this book
alongside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such remarkable way makes the content inside of
easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you for
not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of rewards than
the other book have got such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking technique. So , still
want to hold up having that book? If I were you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Ronda Tollison:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book ended up being rare?
Why so many problem for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some
people likes reading through, not only science book but novel and Hidden (Jacobs Family Series) (Volume 1)
as well as others sources were given information for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel
desire to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or students especially. Those books are
helping them to add their knowledge. In various other case, beside science reserve, any other book likes
Hidden (Jacobs Family Series) (Volume 1) to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book
like this.
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